
Sioux Falls Youth Hockey Association  
 

Equipment Distribution for 2024-2025 Season 
 
 
Who:  Mini-Atom Players – Four yr old skaters 

Atom League Players - Five & Six yr old skaters 
  Mite League Players – Seven & Eight yr old skaters 
  ICL & ACL Flyers – as needed for 9-18 yr olds 
 
When: Wednesday – August 14, 2024  6:00-7:30pm 
  Tuesday – September 17, 2024  6:00-7:30pm 
  Thursday – October 3, 2024  6:00-7:30pm 
  Monday – October 28, 2024  6:00-7:30pm 
   
      
Where: Scheels IcePlex  
  4300 N Bobhalla Avenue 
_______________________________________________________________ 
 
Sioux Falls Youth Hockey Association (SFYHA) provides to Mini-Atoms (4 yr 
olds), Atoms (5 –6 year olds), and Mites (7-8 year olds), the opportunity to rent 
equipment for a minimal fee.  ICL and ACL players, ages 9-18 can rent gear as 
available.  The equipment is the property of SFHYA and parents are required to 
sign a loan agreement and make a refundable deposit.  
 
For Atom and Mite skaters, a helmet/mask, shin guards, elbow pads, hockey 
gloves, shoulder pads, and breezers (hockey shorts) are available as sizes 
permit, for a rental cost of $45.00. Rental fee for Mini-Atoms is $25.00.  This 
should be in the form of a check, made payable to SFYHA.  
 
The refundable deposit of $400.00 is required and must be provided at the time 
the equipment is rented.  The deposit check should be separate from the rental 
check and made payable to SFYHA. This deposit will be returned to you at the 
end of the season, as long as the equipment is returned on time and in good 
condition. Please remember that two separate checks are required – one for the 
rental fee, and one for the refundable deposit. 
 
Rec League players (ages 9 and older) will have the opportunity to rent 
equipment as available from SFYHA.   
 
If you have any questions or concerns, please call Aaron Kompelien, Equipment 
Director at 507-829-1328 or equipment@sfflyers.com 



2024-2025 Sioux Falls Youth Hockey Replacement 
Cost and Equipment Care 

 
 Helmet $  85.00 
 Elbow Pads $  50.00 
 Shin Pads $  50.00 
 Gloves $  55.00 
 Breezers $  60.00 
 Shoulder Pads $  50.00 
 Equipment Bag $  50.00 
  Total $400.00 
 
1. Elbow Pads: If you have the Hockey Pack pads, hand wash with mild detergent 

and air dry.  DO NOT PUT IN DRYER.  If you have the white elbow pads, wash 
in washing machine on the gentle cycle and air dry.  DO NOT PUT IN THE  
DRYER. 

 
2. Shin Pads:  If you have the white pads, you may wash in the washing machine 

on a gentle cycle and air dry.  DO NOT PUT IN DRYER.  If you have the Hockey 
Pack Pads (Profect) hand wash with mild detergent and air dry.  DO NOT PUT IN 
DRYER. 

 
3. Helmets:   Spray with any good cleaner and scrub gently.  If you still have areas 

that are not clean you may use bleach water and a toothbrush and scrub gently.  
Rinse thoroughly.  IT IS IMPORTANT THAT YOU CHECK THE HELMET 
SCREWS ONCE A WEEK AND TIGHTEN WHEN NEEDED. DO NOT OVER 
TIGHTEN THE SCREWS, AS THIS MAY CAUSE THE HELMET TO CRACK.  If 
you lose a helmet screw, please contact your league manager for a replacement. 

 
4. Jerseys:  Wash jerseys inside out on cool setting with mild detergent.  NO 

BLEACH! PLEASE AIR DRY!  Do not soak the jerseys, as the colors will fade.  
Please repair all tears immediately.  Complimentary jersey will be distributed 
after the season starts. 

 
5. Breezers:  Hand wash with mild detergent and air dry.  DO NOT PUT IN 

DRYER. 
 
6. Gloves:    Wipe with mild detergent.  DO NOT PLACE IN WASHER OR DRYER. 
 
7. Shoulder Pads:    Hand wash in mild detergent and air dry.  DO NOT PUT IN 

DRYER. 
 
8. Goalie equipment; Remove all equipment from the bag and air dry after every 

use.  Contact the equipment director or team coordinator immediately if a strap 
breaks or something is torn. 

 
 



PROPER CARE OF EQUIPMENT  
IS YOUR RESPONSIBILITY 


